
CITY OF KERRVILLE 
BUILDING BOARD OF ADJUSTMENT & APPEALS AGENDA 

REGULAR MEETING, OCTOBER 26, 2023 03:00 P.M. 
CITY HALL COUNCIL CHAMBERS 

701 MAIN STREET, KERRVILLE, TEXAS 

1. CALL TO ORDER

2. MINUTES

2A. Approval of Meeting Minutes from the September 29, 2023 meeting

3. PUBLIC HEARING

4A. Unsafe Structure Located at 516 W. Water Street

4B. Unsafe Structure Located at 608 Stephen Street

4C. Unsafe Structure Located at 421 Fifer Street

4. STAFF REPORT

5. ADJOURNMENT

The facility is wheelchair-accessible and accessible parking spaces are available.  Requests for 
accommodations or interpretive services must be made 48 hours prior to this event.  Please contact the 
City Secretary’s Office at 830-258-1117 for further information. 

I do hereby certify that this notice of the meeting was posted on the bulletin board at the city hall of the city 
of Kerrville, Texas, and said notice was posted on the following date and time: 10/20/2023, At 04:45 PM 
and remained posted continuously for at least 72 hours preceding the scheduled time of the meeting. 

Deputy City Secretary, City of Kerrville, Texas 
Kesha Franchina, TRMC



TO BE CONSIDERED BY THE BUILDING BOARD OF ADJUSTMENT AND 
APPEAL 

CITY OF KERRVILLE, TEXAS 
SUBJECT: 2A. Approval of Meeting Minutes from the September 28, 2023 meeting 
AGENDA DATE OF: September 28, 2023 DATE SUBMITTED: October 20, 2023 
SUBMITTED BY: Aaron Barnes, Interim Chief Building Official 
EXHIBITS:  

MEMBERS PRESENT: 

Mack Edmiston, Board Member 

Jennifer Hyde, Board Member 

Daniel Lowery, Board Member 

Caleb Mizell, Board Member 

Bob Rue, Board Member 

Wayne Uecker, Alternate, arrived at 3:16 p.m. 

MEMBERS ABSENT: 

None 

STAFF PRESENT: 

Guillermo Garcia, Executive Director for Innovation 

Aaron Barnes, Interim Chief Building Official 

Dorothy Miller, Recording Secretary 

1. CALL TO ORDER:
On September 28, 2023, the Kerrville Building Board of Adjustment and Appeals regular meeting was
called to order at 3:00 p.m. in the City Hall council chambers, 701 Main Street.

2. ELECTION OF OFFICERS

2A.    Election of Chair and Vice Chair by BBAA members 



 

Guillermo Garcia explained the ordinance and process regarding electing officers.  

 

Bob Rue moved to nominated Jennifer Hyde for chair; motion was seconded by Daniel Lowery and 
passed 4-1.  

 

Daniel Lowery moved to nominate Bob Rue for vice chair; motion was seconded by Jennifer Hyde and 
passed 5-0. 

 

3. APPROVAL OF MINUTES 
 

3A. Approval of the minutes from the August 24, 2023 meeting. 

 

Bob Rue moved to approve the minutes as presented; motion was seconded by Daniel Lowery and 
passed 5-0. 

 

4.  CONSIDERATION AND ACTION 

 

4A.    Recommend adoption of the 2021 International Property Maintenance Code 
 
Guillermo Garcia stated the Board will be reviewing the International Property Maintenance Code and 
discussed some minor administrative changes. 

 

Aaron Barnes presented a power point regarding the 2021 International Property Maintenance Code and 
discussed the following: 

 

Amendments: 

(1) Section 103 Code Compliance Agency is deleted in its entirety. 



 

 

 

(continued) 



 

 

(5) Section 111 Unsafe Structures and Equipment is deleted in its entirety.  

 

(6) Section 113 Demolition is deleted in its entirety. 

 (a) Cost of such demolition or emergency repairs definition is deleted.  

 

(continued) 



 

 

 

(10) 302.8 Motor vehicles is deleted in its entirety. 

 

(11) 304.1.1(8) is deleted in its entirety and items are renumbered.  

 

(12) 304.7 Roofs and drainage is deleted in its entirety. 

 

(13) 304.14 Insect screens is deleted in its entirety. 

 

(14) 308.3.1 Garbage facilities is deleted in entirety. 

( 

(15) 308.3.2 Containers renumbered as 308.3.1. 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 Mack Edmiston moved to recommend adoption of the 2021 International Property Maintenance Code as 
presented; motion was seconded by Bob Rue and passed 5-0.  

 

4B. Recommend adoption of the amendments to the IBC, IRC, IECC, IPC, IMC, IFGC, IEBC, 
ISPSC, IPMC 
 

Guillermo Garcia presented a power point regarding the amendments to the IBC, IRC, IECC, 
IPC, IMC, IFGC, IEBC, ISPSC, and IPMC and discussed the following: 
 

Amendments: 

IBC 

 

 

IRC 

 

 

(2) R105.2 is amended by deleting exemptions 2 and 5 under “Building”. 



 

 

 

IECC

 

 

IEBC 

 

 

IMC 

 

 

 

 

(3) Section 114 Board of Appeals is deleted in its entirety. 



 

ISPSC 

 

 

 

 

IPC 

 

 

IFGC 



 

 

Bob Rue moved to recommend adoption of the amendments to the IBC, IRC, IECC, IPC, IMC, IFGC, IEBC, 
ISPSC, IPMC as presented; motion was seconded by Caleb Mizell and passed 5-0.  

 

5. STAFF REPORT 

 

Guillermo Garcia discussed the following: 

1. Next BBAA meeting will be Thursday, October 26th 
a) Unsafe structures 

 516 W. Water St. 
 608 Stephen St. 
 421 Fifer St. 

 

6. ADJOURNMENT 

The meeting adjourned at 3:44 p.m. 

 

ATTEST: 

 

              

Jennifer Hyde, Chair     Dorothy Miller, Recording Secretary 

 

 

 

  



 

 

 

TO BE CONSIDERED BY THE BUILDING BOARD OF ADJUSTMENT AND 
APPEAL 

CITY OF KERRVILLE, TEXAS 
SUBJECT: 3A. Unsafe Structure located at 516 W. Water Street 
AGENDA DATE OF: August 24, 2023 DATE SUBMITTED: October 20, 2023 
SUBMITTED BY: Aaron Barnes, Interim Chief Building Official 
EXHIBITS: Chief Building Official Property Survey Report 

SUMMARY STATEMENT: 

On April 10, 2023, Code Enforcement received a call about a potentially unsafe structure 
located at 516 W. Water Street.  After an investigation, it was found that the property was in a 
poor state due to a structural fire.  The Chief Building Official and Deputy Fire Marshal were 
called to further investigate and found the structure to be unsafe and a health hazard to the 
public.   

On May 18, 2023, the Chief Building Official in coordination with the Deputy Fire Marshal 
declared the structure to be unsafe as per Sec. 26-233 Emergency Action.  Under this section, 
the Chief Building Official ordered the structure to be secured, a notice was posted on the 
property, and a notification letter was sent to the property owner.   

The Chief Building Official proceeded to communicate to the property owner (deceased), 
mortgagee, and lienholders via a letter of notification and by posting in the local newspaper a 
notification of a public hearing to appear before the Building Board of Adjustment and Appeals. 

The Chief Building Official will present evidence that the structure is unsafe, dilapidated, 
dangerous, and a public nuisance due to the health hazard to the public.  Sec. 26-242 
Application Standards apply: 

(1) The building, dwelling, or any part is likely to partially or fully collapse 

(7) The building has been damaged by fire, …, or other cause to such an extent that it 
has become dangerous to the public health, safety, and welfare. 

City staff provided a copy of the notice per code, however, in preparation to proceed with 
demolition of the property it was discovered that a legal form (Lis Pendens) was needed to 
record the proceeding within the county property record.  Therefore, the process for declaration 
and order to demolish the structure needed to be restarted. 

RECOMMENDED ACTION: 

Order to demolish the structure located at 516 W. Water Street and remove it from the premises 
within 30 days. 

 

  



















 

 

TO BE CONSIDERED BY THE BUILDING BOARD OF ADJUSTMENT AND 
APPEAL 

CITY OF KERRVILLE, TEXAS 
SUBJECT: 3B. Unsafe Structure located at 608 Stephen St. 
AGENDA DATE OF: October 26, 2023 DATE SUBMITTED: October 20, 2023 
SUBMITTED BY: Aaron Barnes, Interim Chief Building Official 
EXHIBITS: Chief Building Official Property Survey Report 

SUMMARY STATEMENT: 

On August 29th, 2023, Interim Chief Building Official Aaron Barnes and Code Enforcement 
Manager Donna Bowyer of the City of Kerrville executed a search warrant on the report that 
there are violations creating an unsafe structure at 608 Stephen St., Kerrville Texas, 78028.  A 
hearing will be held before the Building Board of Adjustment and Appeals to determine whether 
the structure is an unsafe structure pursuant to the provisions of Chapter 26 Buildings and 
Building Regulations, Article VIII - Unsafe Building Abatement; Chapter 58, Article V-Sanitary 
Maintenance of Property; Chapter 46, Article IV – Junked Vehicles; and Chapter 50, Fire 
Prevention and Protection, Article I of the City of Kerrville Code of Ordinances. 

The Chief Building Official will present evidence that the structure is unsafe, dangerous, and a 
public nuisance due to the health hazard to the public.  Sec 58-105 and 50-3 Application 
Standards apply: 

(1) Excessive rubbish, trash, and debris were found throughout the exterior and interior of 
the property.  The excessive rubbish, debris, trash, and debris create an unsanitary 
situation that creates a public nuisance and is illegal. 

(2) The conditions of the excess rubbish, trash, and debris present a clear fire hazard on the 
property. The conditions that exist increase the hazard or menace of fire to a greater 
degree than is normal.  A condition exists that will prevent the suppressing or 
extinguishing of fires that may obstruct, delay, hinder, or interfere with the operations of 
the fire department or prevent the egress of occupants in the event of a fire. 

 

RECOMMENDED ACTION: 

Order to remove/abate all of the excess rubbish, trash and debris from property both interior and 
exterior. 

 

  















 

TO BE CONSIDERED BY THE BUILDING BOARD OF ADJUSTMENT AND 
APPEAL 

CITY OF KERRVILLE, TEXAS 
SUBJECT: 3C. Unsafe Structure located at 421 Fifer St. 
AGENDA DATE OF: October 26, 2023 DATE SUBMITTED: October 20, 2023 
SUBMITTED BY: Aaron Barnes, Interim Chief Building Official 
EXHIBITS: Chief Building Official Property Survey Report 

SUMMARY STATEMENT: 

On September 27th, 2023, Interim Chief Building Official Aaron Barnes and Code Enforcement 
Manager Donna Bowyer of the City of Kerrville executed a search warrant on the report that 
there are violations creating an unsafe structure at 421 Fifer St., Kerrville Texas, 78028.  A 
hearing will be held before the Building Board of Adjustment and Appeals to determine whether 
the structure is an unsafe structure pursuant to the provisions of Chapter 26 Buildings and 
Building Regulations, Article VIII - Unsafe Building Abatement; Chapter 58, Article V-Sanitary 
Maintenance of Property; Chapter 46, Article IV – Junked Vehicles; and Chapter 50, Fire 
Prevention and Protection, Article I of the City of Kerrville Code of Ordinances. 

 

The Chief Building Official will present evidence that the structure is unsafe, dangerous, and a 
public nuisance due to the health hazard to the public.  Sec 58-105 and 50-3 Application 
Standards apply: 

(1) Excessive rubbish, trash, and debris were found throughout the exterior of the property.  
The excessive rubbish, debris, trash, and debris create an unsanitary situation that 
creates a public nuisance and is illegal. 

(2) The conditions of the excess rubbish, trash, and debris present a clear fire hazard on the 
property. The conditions that exist increase the hazard or menace of fire to a greater 
degree than is normal.  A condition exists that will prevent the suppressing or 
extinguishing of fires that may obstruct, delay, hinder, or interfere with the operations of 
the fire department or prevent the egress of occupants in the event of a fire. 

 

RECOMMENDED ACTION: 

Order to remove/abate all of the excess rubbish, trash and debris from property both interior and 
exterior. 

 



















CITY OF KERRVILLE 
BUILDING BOARD OF ADJUSTMENT & APPEALS AGENDA 


REGULAR MEETING, OCTOBER 26, 2023 03:00 P.M. 
CITY HALL COUNCIL CHAMBERS 


701 MAIN STREET, KERRVILLE, TEXAS 


1. CALL TO ORDER


2. MINUTES


2A. Approval of Meeting Minutes from the September 29, 2023 meeting


3. PUBLIC HEARING


4A. Unsafe Structure Located at 516 W. Water Street


4B. Unsafe Structure Located at 608 Stephen Street


4C. Unsafe Structure Located at 421 Fifer Street


4. STAFF REPORT


5. ADJOURNMENT


The facility is wheelchair-accessible and accessible parking spaces are available.  Requests for 
accommodations or interpretive services must be made 48 hours prior to this event.  Please contact the 
City Secretary’s Office at 830-258-1117 for further information. 


I do hereby certify that this notice of the meeting was posted on the bulletin board at the city hall of the city 
of Kerrville, Texas, and said notice was posted on the following date and time: 10/20/2023, At 04:45 PM 
and remained posted continuously for at least 72 hours preceding the scheduled time of the meeting. 


Deputy City Secretary, City of Kerrville, Texas 
Kesha Franchina, TRMC







